







# Maximum employment period - 6 months

	CONTRACT#	VENDOR	SWAM	ADDRESS	CONTACT	EMAIL	Contact number	Zones
1	C-1567-17-A	 <b>CYNET SYSTEMS</b> <a href="http://WWW.CYNETSYSTEMS.COM">WWW.CYNETSYSTEMS.COM</a>	Minority, Woman, Small	43480 Yukon Dr.#202, Ashburn, VA 20147	Arpit Paul	<a href="mailto:arpitp@cynetsystems.com">arpitp@cynetsystems.com</a>	571-389-7458	All
2	C-1567-17-B	 <b>THE SEDONA GROUP</b> <a href="http://www.sedonagroup.com">www.sedonagroup.com</a>	Woman, Small	4198 Cox Road, Suite 108, Glen Allen, VA 23060	Lois Latham	<a href="mailto:sedonagp@hotmail.com">sedonagp@hotmail.com</a>	804-290-0799	All
3	C-1567-17-C	 <b>ISS</b> Integrity Staffing Services <a href="http://www.integritystaffing.net">www.integritystaffing.net</a>	Woman	615 Lynnhaven Parkway, Va Beach, VA 23452	Bryan Hartley	<a href="mailto:dhartley@integritystaffing.net">dhartley@integritystaffing.net</a>	757-420-0355	5 & 6 Only
4	C-1567-17-D	 <b>Reliance</b> STAFFING & RECRUITING <a href="http://www.reliancestaffing.com">www.reliancestaffing.com</a>	Woman	1090 Loftis Blvd. Newport News, VA 23606	Lynn Connor	<a href="mailto:lconnor@reliancestaffing.com">lconnor@reliancestaffing.com</a>	757.873.6644	5 Only
5	C-1567-17-E	 <b>SAUNDERS STAFFING</b> <a href="mailto:saunderssem@saundersstaffing.net">saunderssem@saundersstaffing.net</a>	Woman, Small	1928 Front Street, Richlands, Virginia, 24631	Connie Saunders	<a href="mailto:saunderssem@saundersstaffing.net">saunderssem@saundersstaffing.net</a>	276-964-5900	All
6	C-1567-17-F	 <b>SAVERA WORKS</b> <a href="http://www.saveraworks.com">www.saveraworks.com</a>	Minority, Woman,	18275 Riviera Way, Leesburg, VA 20176	Usma Khan,	<a href="mailto:ukhan@saveraworks.com">ukhan@saveraworks.com</a>	703 508-2402	All
7	C-1567-17-G	 <b>Caliper</b> A Tech Company <a href="http://www.caliper.net">www.caliper.net</a>	Small	4907 Fitzhugh Ave, Suite 201, Richmond, VA 23230	Jessica Rigggenbach	<a href="mailto:jrigggenbach@cor-tech.net">jrigggenbach@cor-tech.net</a>	757-486-3838	All
8	C-1567-17-H	 <b>EMPLOYMENT ENTERPRISES INC</b> Strengthen Your Workforce <a href="http://www.eeihr.com">www.eeihr.com</a>	Woman, Small	10500 Wakeman Drive, Suite 105, Fredericksburg, VA 22407	Gala Johnson	<a href="mailto:gjohnson@eeihr.com">gjohnson@eeihr.com</a>	703-361-2220 ext. 235	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, & 8
9	C-1567-17-I	 <b>ARVON STAFFING</b> Virginia Beach: 757-499-9900 Newport News: 757-499-5551 <a href="http://www.arvon.com">www.arvon.com</a>	n/a	714 J. Clyde Morris Blvd, Suite 130, Newport News, VA 23601	Kristin Fetty	<a href="mailto:kfetty@arvon.com">kfetty@arvon.com</a>	757-595-5551	5 Only
10	C-1567-17-J	 <b>ABACUS</b> <a href="http://www.AbacusCorporation.com">www.AbacusCorporation.com</a>	n/a	2500 E. Parham Rd, Suite 4, Richmond, VA 23228	Trey Daniels	<a href="mailto:tdaniels@abacuscorporation.com">tdaniels@abacuscorporation.com</a>	800-325-3268 x 226	All
11	C-1567-17-K	 <b>PREMIER STAFFING SOURCE</b> <a href="http://www.premierstaffingsource.com">www.premierstaffingsource.com</a>	Minority, Woman,	4640 Forbes Blvd., Suite 200A, Lanham, MD 20706	Elizabeth Harris	<a href="mailto:eharris@premierstaffingsource.com">eharris@premierstaffingsource.com</a>	301-306-0774	All
12	C-1567-17-L	 <b>VERNACULAR</b> Language Services <a href="http://www.vernacularlanguage.com">www.vernacularlanguage.com</a>	Minority, Woman, Small	8280 Willow Oaks Corporate Drive, Suite 600 • Fairfax, VA 22031	Adam Tran	<a href="mailto:adam@vernacularlanguage.com">adam@vernacularlanguage.com</a>	703-226-9605	All
13	C-1567-17-M	 <b>CURZON</b> Staffing <a href="http://www.curzonstaffing.com">www.curzonstaffing.com</a>	Minority, Woman, Small	675 N. Washington Street, Ste 420 Alexandria, VA 22314	Karen Wishart	<a href="mailto:kwishart@curzonstaffing.com">kwishart@curzonstaffing.com</a>	703-836-4403	5 Only
14	C-1567-17-O	 <b>Adecco</b> <a href="http://www.adeccousa.com">www.adeccousa.com</a>	n/a	525 S Independence Blvd, Suite 120, Va Beach, VA 23452	Lauren Macy or Betsy Phillips	<a href="mailto:lauren.siegel@adeccona.com">lauren.siegel@adeccona.com</a> ; <a href="mailto:betsy.phillips@adeccona.com">betsy.phillips@adeccona.com</a>	757-490-0904; 434-851- 9250	All





# Maximum employment period - 6 months

15 - Premier Staffing Source						17 - Vernacular Language Services						19 - Kandellen Group dba Curzon Staffing						22 - Adecco							
4640 Forbes Boulevard · Suite 200A · Lanham MD 20706						8280 Willow Oaks Corporate Drive, Suite 600 Fairfax, VA 22031						1908 Mount Vernon Ave 3rd Floor Alexandria, VA 22310						525 S. Independence Blvd, Suite 120, Virginia Beach, VA 23452							
Elizabeth Harris -(866) 782-4674 Eharris@premierstaffingsource.com						Adam Tran - 703-842-5353 adam@vernacularlanguage.com www.vernacularlanguage.com						Karen Wishart - (703) 836-4403 kwishart@curzonstaffing.com						Betsy Phillips - Office 434.239.0013 Cell 434.851.9250, Fax 434.239.8568 betsy.phillips@adeccona.com							
Zone 5						Zone 5						Zone 5						Zone 5							
Contractor Pays		Contractor Admin		College Pays		Contractor Pays		Contractor Admin		College Pays		Contractor Pays		Contractor Admin		College Pays		Contractor Pays		Contractor Admin		College Pays			
Job Classification	Employee	Plus	Mark Up	Equals		Employee	Plus	Up	Equals		Employee	Plus	Up	Equals		Employee	Plus	Up	Equals		Employee	Plus	Up	Equals	
<b>Regular Time</b>																									
1 Receptionist	\$10.40	+	31%	=	\$13.62	\$ 15.44	+	\$ 6.01	=	\$ 21.45	\$ 8.50	+	\$ 4.12	=	\$ 12.62	\$10.00	+	42%	=	\$14.20					
Administrative/Fiscal																									
2 Coordinator	\$16.83	+	31%	=	\$22.04	\$ 15.17	+	\$ 5.89	=	\$ 21.06	\$ 8.75	+	\$ 4.25	=	\$ 13.00	\$12.00	+	42%	=	\$17.04					
3 Administrative Assistant I	\$10.00	+	31%	=	\$13.10	\$ 18.03	+	\$ 7.03	=	\$ 25.06	\$ 8.75	+	\$ 4.25	=	\$ 13.00	\$11.00	+	42%	=	\$15.62					
4 Administrative Assistant II	\$11.50	+	31%	=	\$15.07	\$ 20.49	+	\$ 8.01	=	\$ 28.50	\$ 9.25	+	\$ 4.49	=	\$ 13.74	\$12.00	+	42%	=	\$17.04					
5 Administrative Assistant III	\$12.65	+	31%	=	\$16.57	\$ 25.17	+	\$ 9.88	=	\$ 35.05	\$ 10.00	+	\$ 4.85	=	\$ 14.85	\$14.00	+	42%	=	\$19.88					
6 Fiscal Coordinator	\$10.30	+	31%	=	\$13.49	\$ 18.36	+	\$ 7.17	=	\$ 25.53	\$ 9.50	+	\$ 4.61	=	\$ 14.11	\$12.00	+	42%	=	\$17.04					
7 Fiscal Technician	\$13.24	+	31%	=	\$17.34	\$ 15.21	+	\$ 5.91	=	\$ 21.12	\$ 11.00	+	\$ 5.34	=	\$ 16.34	\$15.00	+	42%	=	\$21.30					
8 Trades Worker	\$9.54	+	31%	=	\$12.49	\$ 16.42	+	\$ 6.38	=	\$ 22.80						\$14.00	+	47%	=	\$20.58					
9 Housekeeping/Custodial	\$9.00	+	31%	=	\$11.79	\$ 12.76	+	\$ 4.94	=	\$ 17.70						\$9.50	+	47%	=	\$13.97					
10 Moving & Storage Laborer	\$11.87	+	31%	=	\$15.54	\$ 12.88	+	\$ 4.98	=	\$ 17.86						\$11.00	+	47%	=	\$16.17					
11 Ground Worker	\$9.05	+	31%	=	\$11.86	\$ 12.56	+	\$ 4.85	=	\$ 17.41						\$11.00	+	47%	=	\$16.17					
12 Postal Clerk	\$9.19	+	31%	=	\$12.03	\$ 13.86	+	\$ 5.37	=	\$ 19.23						\$11.50	+	47%	=	\$16.91					
13 Postal Technician	\$10.03	+	31%	=	\$13.14	\$ 13.55	+	\$ 5.25	=	\$ 18.80	\$ 9.25	+	\$ 4.49	=	\$ 13.74	\$12.50	+	42%	=	\$17.75					
14 Arborist Support Worker	\$18.75	+	31%	=	\$24.56	\$ 12.70	+	\$ 4.91	=	\$ 17.61						No Bid	+	No Bid	=	No Bid					
15 Special Events Specialist	\$17.79	+	31%	=	\$23.30	\$ 12.68	+	\$ 4.90	=	\$ 17.58	\$ 9.25	+	\$ 4.49	=	\$ 13.74	\$11.00	+	47%	=	\$16.17					
																									
<a href="http://www.premierstaffingsource.com">www.premierstaffingsource.com</a>						<a href="http://www.vernacularlanguage.com">www.vernacularlanguage.com</a>						<a href="http://www.curzonstaffing.com">www.curzonstaffing.com</a>						<a href="http://www.adeccousa.com">www.adeccousa.com</a>							
<b>Over Time</b>																									
16 Receptionist	\$15.60	+	23%	=	\$19.19	\$ 23.16	+	\$ 9.02	=	\$ 32.18	\$ 12.75	+	\$ 6.18	=	\$ 18.93	\$15.00	+	42%	=	\$21.30					
Administrative/Fiscal																									
17 Coordinator	\$25.24	+	23%	=	\$31.04	\$ 22.76	+	\$ 8.84	=	\$ 31.60	\$ 13.13	+	\$ 6.36	=	\$ 19.49	\$18.00	+	42%	=	\$25.56					
18 Administrative Assistant I	\$15.00	+	23%	=	\$18.45	\$ 27.05	+	\$ 10.55	=	\$ 37.60	\$ 13.13	+	\$ 6.36	=	\$ 19.49	\$16.50	+	42%	=	\$23.43					
19 Administrative Assistant II	\$17.25	+	23%	=	\$21.22	\$ 30.74	+	\$ 12.02	=	\$ 42.76	\$ 13.88	+	\$ 6.73	=	\$ 20.60	\$18.00	+	42%	=	\$25.56					
20 Administrative Assistant III	\$18.98	+	23%	=	\$23.34	\$ 37.76	+	\$ 14.82	=	\$ 52.58	\$ 15.00	+	\$ 7.28	=	\$ 22.28	\$21.00	+	42%	=	\$29.82					
21 Fiscal Coordinator	\$15.45	+	23%	=	\$19.00	\$ 27.54	+	\$ 10.76	=	\$ 38.30	\$ 14.25	+	\$ 6.92	=	\$ 21.17	\$18.00	+	42%	=	\$25.56					
22 Fiscal Technician	\$19.85	+	23%	=	\$24.42	\$ 22.82	+	\$ 8.87	=	\$ 31.69	\$ 16.50	+	\$ 8.00	=	\$ 24.50	\$22.50	+	42%	=	\$31.95					
23 Trades Worker	\$14.30	+	23%	=	\$17.59	\$ 24.63	+	\$ 9.57	=	\$ 34.20						\$21.00	+	47%	=	\$30.87					
24 Housekeeping/Custodial	\$13.50	+	23%	=	\$16.61	\$ 19.14	+	\$ 7.41	=	\$ 26.55						\$14.25	+	47%	=	\$20.95					
25 Moving & Storage Laborer	\$17.80	+	23%	=	\$21.89	\$ 19.32	+	\$ 7.47	=	\$ 26.79						\$16.50	+	47%	=	\$24.26					
26 Ground Worker	\$13.58	+	23%	=	\$16.70	\$ 18.84	+	\$ 7.28	=	\$ 26.12						\$16.50	+	47%	=	\$24.26					
27 Postal Clerk	\$13.78	+	23%	=	\$16.95	\$ 20.79	+	\$ 8.06	=	\$ 28.85						\$17.25	+	47%	=	\$25.36					
28 Postal Technician	\$15.05	+	23%	=	\$18.51	\$ 20.33	+	\$ 7.88	=	\$ 28.21	\$ 13.88	+	\$ 6.73	=	\$ 20.60	\$18.75	+	42%	=	\$26.63					
29 Arborist Support Worker	\$28.12	+	23%	=	\$34.58	\$ 19.05	+	\$ 7.37	=	\$ 26.42						No Bid	+	No Bid	=	No Bid					
30 Special Events Specialist	\$26.68	+	23%	=	\$32.81	\$ 19.02	+	\$ 7.35	=	\$ 26.37	\$ 13.88	+	\$ 6.73	=	\$ 20.60	\$16.50	+	47%	=	\$24.26					